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Special Projects Coordinator Clerk Administrator

Resolution No. 23-21

The Logan County Board of Commissioners met in regular open session on this date of January 21, 2021
with full board present

Mr. Joe Antram moved that the following resolution be adopted:
RE: AWARD BID- 2021 AGGREGATE (STONE)-LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER
WHEREAS, bids were received on January 19, 2021 for Aggregate (Stone), and

WHEREAS, bids were received from Duff’s Quarry, Inc., Neer’s Sand & Gravel, LLC, and Shelly Materials Inc.
and these bids have been reviewed by the Logan County Engineer, and

WHEREAS, the Logan County Engineer recommend that due to the small differential in cost and the location of
the bidder’s plants in our county, all bids be accepted.

THEREFORE, BE IT HEREBY RESOLVED, by the Logan County Board of Commissioners to authorize the

Logan County Engineer to purchase necessary aggregate (stone) from each of the suppliers based upon cost,
length of haul to job site and availability of material at the time of the project.
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Mr. Paul Benedetti, President

Mr. Mark Robinson seconded the motion.

Roll call resulted as follows:
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Mr. Joseph M. Aiffram, Member

I, De De Doss, Clerk/Administrator, hereby certify this to be a true copy of the proceedings as taken from the
minutes of the meeting of the Logan County Commissioners on this date of January 21, 2021.
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De De Doss, Clerk/Administrator
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OFFICE OF THE
LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER
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SCOTT C. COLEMAN, P.E., P.S. Telephone: (937) 592-2791
LOGAN COUNTY ENGINEER Fax: (937) 599-2658

January 19, 2021

The Honorable Board of APPRGL IO BY OF
Logan County Commissioners LOGAXN SOUNTY COMiinu.ui. 128
117 E. Columbus Avenue, Suite 100 momon A
Bellefontaine, OH 43311 wmy [}j& -

PER RESOLUTION# __ R D Z
Re:  Aggregate (Stone) Bids for 2021 DATED Jrl'fl [ FLZI :

January 19, 2021 at 11:00 A.M.
Gentlemen:

Attached is a tabulation of bids received by your honorable board on January 19, 2021 for
aggregate to be used by the Highway Department during 2021.

Due to the small differential in cost and the location of the bidder’s plants in our county, I

recommend that your honorable board adopt a resolution authorizing our department to purchase
necessary aggregate from each of the suppliers based upon cost, length of haul to job site and
availability of material at the time of project requirement.

In accordance with ORC 9.24, we have checked the Auditor of State’s Unresolved Findings for

Recovery Database and the federal system for awards management. The responsive bidders
were not listed and we have retained the certified search confirmation pages in the project file.

Respectfully submitted,

Autl——

Scott C. Coleman, P.E., P.S.
Logan County Engineer

SCC/wtb

Attachment



2021 STONE BID CHART - BID DATE: JANUARY 19, 2021

SHELLY DUFF NEER'S
AGGREGATE SIZE |UNIT MATERIAL Quarry Sand and Gravel
Belle Center
No. 1 TON $25.00
NO. 2 TON $11.20 $12.00 $11.00
NO. 4 TON $11.20 $12.00 $11.00
NO. 422-A TON $18.00 $15.50 No Bid
NO. 6 TON $12.40 $12.25 $11.50
NO. 67 TON $14.75 $13.00 No Bid
NO. 8 TON $17.50 $15.50 $12.00
NO. 9 TON $10.50 $11.25 No Bid
NO. 310 TON No Bid $11.00 No Bid
NO. 304 TON $10.00 $11.00 $11.00
NO. 617 TON $10.00 $11.00 $10.50
QUARRY ROCK TON No Bid No Bid No Bid
FLAT ROCK TON No Bid No Bid No Bid
ICE GRITS TON $10.50 $11.00 No Bid
BANK RUN GRAVEL |TON No Bid No Bid $9.50
BOULDERS TON No Bid No Bid $100.00
RIPRAP A,B,C,D |TON $24.00 $23.50 No Bid




